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1737. December 2r. MONTGOMiERIE afgainst MONTGOMERIE.

No 211.
ONE disponed a tenement to a stranger, with this provision, ' That the

disponee, by a'ccepting of the disposition, should be bound to pay a yearly
annuity to the granter's heir.' In a process for piyment of the annuity, fhe

defence was, That he had not as yet resolved, whether he would accept of the
disposition, and there is no law obliging him to accept within a limited time.-
Answered, This is implied in the nature of the thing. It would be uinreasonable
to bring the pursuer under the necessity of entering heir, and subjecting him-

TV. V.

AGNES INNES, relict of Laurence Ord, William Oliphant merchant in Edin-
burgh., and John Doull, writer there,. as, creditors to the said Laurence, pursue
John Lutefoot, writer to the signet, as he who accepted a disposition from the
said Laurence Ord of his whole estate, with the burden of his whole debts and
legacies, in so far as Laurence's papers being, after his death, by warrant of
the Commissaries; sequestrated at the CFeditors' desire, the 'said John Lutefoot
had borrowed up that disposition, which was lying with the rest, and had en-
tered into a transaction with Christian Ord, -Laurence's only daughter, and
William Graham her husband, and, Trnounoed the said disposition in their fa.
your, on their paying him 2200 merksasi reWard.-Aleged for John Lutefoot,
That he was so far from acceptihg of that disposition, or doing any deedim,
porting a homologation of the same, that he had expressly repudiated it, and
declared he would have no benefit of the same, in so far as he had renounced
it in favouir of the said Laurence's heir; and she being served heir, the credi-
tors had no prejudice, for she and her'husband would be liable ; and he did not
transact rashly, but by the advice of lawyers; and the gratuity given him was
no price for. his renunciation, but expressly given for the many services he had
done'to Laurence, the defunct.-Answered, He taking up the disposition from
the Commissary-clerk, and never returning it, was a clear acceptance; and his
renunciation being in favorem, and not simple, can never liberate him; and
though he depones in his oath, that the gratuity was merely for his.services, yet
res ipsa loquitur that it was for the renunciation; and her being served heir im-
ports nothing, seeing she has done it cun benejicio inventrii on the late act of
Parliament; so the whole is but a contrivanLe to defraud creditors, and John
Lutefoot may recur againli her for his relief -THE LORDS found his accepta-
tion sufficiently proved, and therefore fourid him liable, and oecerned; especial-
ly rer not being integra to the creditors, who were daninified by it, and that his
disposition 'was burdened with the debts.
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